
Memo 

To: 

From: 

Date: 

Motion: 

Board of Directors 

Robert McLeod
April 20, 2022 

Motion to Approve Budgeted Golf Capital Equipment Purchases 

Motion 

I move to approve the purchase of the following budgeted Golf Capital items: Two (2) Rough Drag 

Units from Toro, One (1) 300 Gallon Green Sprayer from Jerry Pate, Two (2) Pull Behind Turbine 

Blowers from P&K, One (1) Lely Spreader from P&K, Three (3) Deck Mowers from P&K, One (1) 
Mower Deck, and One (1) Zero Turn Rough Mower from Horns for a total bulk purchase price of

$302,844.02

Background 

The requested capital equipment is currently in deferred status. The Golf Department placed bid requests for 

18 budgeted pieces of equipment. Due to supply chain issues and price increases, only 11 items are proposed 

to purchase.  

Two (2) Rough Drag Units Bid Vendor 

Bid 1: 85,123.40 Jerry Pate 

Bid 2: 89,792.10 LADD 

Bid 3: 66,567.90 P&K 

Bid 4: No Bid Horns 

Budget: $75,000

300 Gallon Green Sprayer Bid Vendor 

Bid 1: 57,606.44 Jerry Pate 

Bid 2: 45,962.66 LADD 

Bid 3: No Bid P&K 

Bid 4: No Bid Horns 

Budget: $53,152.00 
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2 Pull Behind Turbine Blowers Bid Vendor 

Bid 1: 20,509.32 P&K 

Bid 2:            26,289.80 Jerry Pate 

Bid 3:   19,579.00 LADD 

Bid 4: No Bid Horns 

Budget: $18,000 

Lely Spreader Bid Vendor 

Bid 1: 8,496.56 P&K 

Bid 2: 7,769.81 LADD 

Bid 3:            10,189.80 Jerry Pate 

Bid 4: No Bid Horns 

Budget: $12,000 

Three (3) Deck Mowers Bid Vendor 

Bid 1: 98,376.96 P&K 

Bid 2: 80,579.49 LADD 

Bid 3: 100,539.96 Jerry Pate 

Bid 4: No Bid Horns 

Budget: $90,000 

Mower Deck Bid Vendor 

Bid 1: 6,286.38 P&K 

Bid 2:            26,859.81 LADD 

Bid 3: No Bid Jerry Pate 

Bid 4: No Bid Horns 

Budget: $24,000 

Zero Turn Rough Mower Bid Vendor 

Bid 1: 26,444.96 Horns 

Bid 2: 61,381.52 LADD 

Bid 3: 44,877.24 Jerry Pate 

Bid 4: No Bid P&K 

Budget: $30,000 



3 

Total Budget All Equipment:  $302,152.00 

Total Actual:  $302,844.02 

We chose the higher bid from Jerry Pate for the 300 Gallon Green Sprayer. LADD, the only other company 

who submitted a proposal, bid for a 200-gallon sprayer, which did not meet our required specifications. 

We chose the middle bid from P&K for the Pull Behind Turbine Blowers, which is only slightly higher than 

the lowest bid. The lowest bid was from LADD, and we do not carry replacement and repair parts for this 

item. We do carry parts for the equipment if purchased from P&K, which will save money in repair costs 

long-term.  

We chose the middle bid from P&K for the Lely Spreader. Purchasing this product from P&K allows us to 

get better bulk pricing for the additional products we are purchasing, including the mower deck, turbine 

blowers, and three deck mowers. It is also a higher quality than the lowest bid from LADD. 

We chose the middle bid from P&K for the three deck mowers. This is due to not having parts available for 

the LADD deck mowers. We have parts available for the mowers if purchased from P&K. This will reduce 

repair costs and any downtime for machinery long-term. These mowers are expected to be available by 

February 2023.  

All other equipment proposed for purchase was chosen as the lowest bid. The original bid was for 18 pieces 

of budgeted equipment. After further evaluation of all bids, we are choosing to request 11 items at this time 

due to lack of supply as well as significant price increases. We are striving to buy the correct equipment at the 

best price.  



PROJECT NAME:

DEPARTMENT: REQUESTED BOARD DATE: 4/6/2022

Board Approval
Discussion/ 

Presentation
X Other (Specify

Base Price Freight Sales Tax Grand Total

LADD 527,217.90                 42,177.43            569,395.33                                                          
587,153.61                 46,972.29            634,125.90                                                          

P&K 88,494.20                   7,079.54              95573.74

96,910.50                   7,752.84              104,663.34                                                          

COST BUDGETED UNBUDGETED NOTES

302,844$                    302,152$                 692$                         Small overage due to cost increases. 

302,844$                    302,152$                 692$                         -$                                                                         

Responsible Director

Project Manager

Tom Heffer

Tom Heffer

JUSTIFICATION

The requested capital equipment items are in deferrment and are needed on the courses. Many items are backordered, and pricing is increasing 

substantially as the year continues. The Golf Department justifies early bulk ordering of all required items within reasonable prices as soon as 

possible in order to receive the equipment in a timely manner. Some items will not be received until later this year or early 2023 due to issues in 

supply. 

ITEM

Jerry Pate

Prices varied in bids submitted by vendors solicited. Therefore, department proposes to purchase items at various vendors based on item 

specification requirements and competitive bid price in order to maximize cost reduction. Breakdown of each bid per vendor is available on 

Procurement Sheet and Board Discussion Memo. 

BUDGET DETAILS

REQUESTED ACTION 

BID INFORMATION

BID (recommended bid in bold)

HORNS

Bulk Purchase from Vendors based on bid price and 

equipment specifications

PROJECT/CAPITAL SUMMARY

Bulk purchase of the following budgeted Golf Capital items: Two (2) Rough Drag Units from Toro, One (1) 300 Gallon Green Sprayer from Jerry Pate, 

Two (2) Pull Behind Turbine Blowers from P&K, One (1) Lely Spreader from P&K, Three (3) Deck Mowers from P&K, One (1) Mower Deck, and One 

(1) Zero Turn Rough Mower from Horns for a total bulk purchase price of $302,844.02

NOTES

BOARD AGENDA FACT SHEET

Golf Department - multiple courses

AUTHORIZATION FOR MAJOR EXPENDITURES

Golf Equipment Bulk Capital Equipment Purchase



RFQ 49732-22 Golf Equipment Total Budget $514,152.00
CAPITAL NUMBER DEPT. CAPITAL ITEM BUDGET LADD BUDGET JERRY PATE BUDGET P & K BUDGET P & K BUDGET HORNS 

18255-000-G550 G550 Backhoe attachment $10,000.00 NO BID $10,000.00 NO BID $10,000.00 NO BID $10,000.00 $10,000.00 NO BID

18256-000-G550 G550 Rotary deck Mower $30,000.00 $61,381.52 $30,000.00 $44,877.24 $30,000.00 NO BID $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $26,444.96

18257-000-G600 G600 Drag Unit $35,000.00 $44,896.05 $35,000.00 $42,561.70 $35,000.00 $33,283.93 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 NO BID

18206-000-G600 G600 Pull Behind Blower $10,000.00 $9,789.50 $10,000.00 $13,144.91 $10,000.00 $10,254.66 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 NO BID

18258-000-G600 G600 Lelly spreader $12,000.00 $7,769.81 $12,000.00 $10,189.80 $12,000.00 $8,496.56 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 NO BID

18259-000-G600 G600 Workcart $12,000.00 $12,818.59 $12,000.00 $17,585.80 $12,000.00 NO BID $12,000.00 $12,000.00 NO BID

18260-000-G650 G650 Turbine blower $8,000.00 $9,789.50 $8,000.00 $13,144.91 $8,000.00 $10,254.66 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 NO BID

18261-000-G650 G650 Cushman work cart $22,000.00 $37,897.88 $22,000.00 $40,070.03 $22,000.00 NO BID $22,000.00 $22,000.00 NO BID

18262-000-G650 G650 Deckmower $24,000.00 $26,859.81 $24,000.00 $33,513.31 $24,000.00 NO BID $24,000.00 $6,286.38 $24,000.00 NO BID

18265-000-G700 G700 Rough Mower $40,000.00 $44,896.05 $40,000.00 $42,561.70 $40,000.00 $33,283.93 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 NO BID

18266-000-G700 G700 Sand Pro $21,000.00 $25,399.92 $21,000.00 $31,893.48 $21,000.00 NO BID $21,000.00 $21,000.00 NO BID

18267-000-G750 G750 Sidewinder mower $42,000.00 $45,318.21 $42,000.00 $51,514.38 $42,000.00 NO BID $42,000.00 $42,000.00 NO BID

18268-000-G750 G750 Deck Mower $30,000.00 $26,859.83 $30,000.00 $33,513.31 $30,000.00 NO BID $30,000.00 $32,792.32 $30,000.00 NO BID

18266-000G800 G800 Sand Pro $21,000.00 $25,399.92 $21,000.00 $31,893.48 $21,000.00 NO BID $21,000.00 $21,000.00 NO BID

18268-000-G800 G800 Deck Mower $30,000.00 $26,859.83 $30,000.00 $33,513.31 $30,000.00 NO BID $30,000.00 $32,792.32 $30,000.00 NO BID

18268-000-G850 G850 Deck Mower $30,000.00 $26,859.83 $30,000.00 $33,513.32 $30,000.00 NO BID $30,000.00 $32,792.32 $30,000.00 NO BID

18267-000-G850 G850 Sidewinder mower $42,000.00 $45,318.21 $42,000.00 $51,514.39 $42,000.00 NO BID $42,000.00 $42,000.00 NO BID

18267-000-G900 G900 Sidewinder mower $42,000.00 $45,318.21 $42,000.00 $51,514.39 $42,000.00 NO BID $42,000.00 $42,000.00 NO BID

18221-000-G800 G800 300 Gallon Self Contained Sprayer $53,152.00 $45,962.66 $53,152.00 $57,606.44 $53,152.00 NO BID $53,152.00 $53,152.00 NO BID

Budget w/ Items Bid Per Vendor $504,152.00 $569,395.33 $504,152.00 $634,125.90 $105,000.00 $95,573.74 $114,000.00 $104,663.34 $32,648.08

The above includes tax The above includes tax The above includes tax The above includes tax -$8,162.00

BUDGET $302,152.00 Tax Tax $1,958.88

ACTUAL $302,844.02 Total $95,573.74 Total $104,663.34 $26,444.96

JUSTIFICATION OF PROJECT / SERVICE :

ORIGINATOR TOM HEFFER

DIRECTOR TOM HEFFER

GENERAL MANAGER KELLY HALE 

CONTROLLER COREENA FETTERHOFF 

RELEASE FOR PO _____________________________

DATE: _____________________________










































































